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I’m currently in my second and last year of college, doing a level 3 
health and social care Btec, with aims to go on and study psychology 
in university next year. I’ve also just recently got a job doing support 
work, where I go to vulnerable peoples houses who need support 
with their day to day living. 

Throughout high school I would never of imagined me being where I 
am now, but with a positive attitude and positive mindset absolutely 
anything is possible! When you have negative thoughts like “there’s 
no point in trying, I’ve already ruined it now” and “I give up”, literally 
just change them! Only you are in charge of your thoughts and 
feelings, and what you have to do is realise you have your whole life 
ahead of you, and you will never be this young again, so change how 
you think. When those thoughts are there, speak to a member of staff 
about them, honestly all the teachers at the McKee understand more 
than anyone, they are literally trained to help and support you, so use 
it whilst you can! I did and now I’m studying towards a career where I 
make £36,000+, achieving top grades and gaining jobs that help 
support my future career. If you want a bright future where you will 
be able to have a nice house, with nice cars and nice fancy things, 
then you have to put the work in! In life things aren’t handed to you, 
you get what you give out. I didn’t realise this till about 6 weeks 
before my GCSE’s so remember there is always time!


